
Prayer Warrior List  
J A N U A R Y  1 5 - 2 1 ,  2 0 2 4  

 

Rejoice always, pray continually, give thanks in all 

circumstances; for this is God’s will for you in Christ Jesus. 
1 Thessalonians 5:16-18 

 
15 Mon: Happy birthday to Kellie Miller!  Please pray for Pastor Dave & 
Elise and their children, Ben, Lydia, Annalise, and Jake. Pray for God to 
protect Pastor Dave and his family in every way - spiritually, physically, 
mentally, emotionally.  
 

16 Tue: Happy birthday to Kristen Bearley! Please pray for Todd Kearns 
as he does rehab for his shoulder. Please pray for healing and a full 
recovery. Please also pray for spiritual unity among our church family, 
staff, and leadership.   
 

17 Wed: Happy birthday to Donna Peachey! Please pray for Matt & Debi 
Zook and their children, Melody, William, and Nathanael. Pray against 
discouragement, disappointment, fear, and doubt. Ask the Lord to bring 
people into their lives who would encourage and uplift them.   
 

18 Thurs: Please pray for Christian & Kaydee Knouse and their children, 

David and Evelyn. Please also pray for the children at Mountain View. 

Pray for our children’s protection from negative influences that would 

lead them away from God. Pray they will be surrounded with friendships 

and mentor-type relationships that portray what it means to live a 

Christ-centered life. 
 

19 Fri:  Please pray for our Elders, Frank Luke, Jon Miller, Boots 
Kauffman, and David Aungst. Pray for wisdom and discernment as they 
meet and discuss different matters. Pray also pray for their families. 
 

20 Sat: Happy birthday to Ben & Hannah Wade! Please pray for Zelda 
Krepps.  Also, please pray for Francis & Leah Daytec and their children, 
Julia, Avea, and Justice. Pray for their safety as they travel to visit friends 
and family. Pray that their time in the US will be a time of refreshment 
for the family.  

 

21 Sun: Sanctity of Human Life Sunday. Please pray for Crossroads 
Pregnancy Center. Pray for their board, staff, and volunteers as they 
actively work to end abortion and help those affected by it. Galatians 6:9 
– “And let us not grow weary of doing good, for in due season we will 
reap, if we do not give up.” 
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